

ITB 07-18 Annual Wooden Pole Contract		Approx. Yearly Qty	Gresco	Gresco (Alternate)	Anixter	Wesco
100271	30' CLASS 4	60	\$115.31	\$130.40	\$118.95	NO BID
100272	35' CLASS 4	15	\$147.96	\$166.35	\$152.65	NO BID
100273	40' CLASS 4	55	\$192.86	\$209.23	\$198.95	NO BID
100274	45' CLASS 3	25	\$278.57	\$285.71	\$287.40	NO BID
100275	50' CLASS 2	25	\$372.45	\$400.73	\$384.25	NO BID
100276	55' CLASS 2	7	\$440.82	\$480.36	\$454.75	NO BID
100282	60' CLASS 2	3	\$543.88	\$612.10	\$561.05	NO BID
100277	65' CLASS 2	1	\$790.82	\$791.60	\$815.80	NO BID
100279	70' CLASS 2	0	\$1,136.73	\$1,007.17	\$1,173.00	NO BID
100281	75' CLASS 2	0	\$1,437.76	\$1,135.00	\$1,484.00	NO BID

Price based on 2017 usage

Manufacturer

\$41,529.00

LANGDALE

\$44,978.32

McFarland

\$42,842.45

COX Pole Co