

ITB 18-18 Smyrna Substation Equipment			GRESKO		ABB Superior Power Products		HICO America		Hyundai Corporation USA		SIEMENS	
DESCRIPTION	UOM	QTY	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
Power Transformer, 115-23 kV, 18/24/30//33.6 MVA, with LTC	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$648,150.00	\$1,296,300.00	\$691,500.00	\$1,383,000.00	\$586,566.00	\$1,173,132.00	NO BID	NO BID
Power Transformer Installation and Field Testing	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$54,400.00	\$54,400.00	\$66,000.00	\$66,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$55,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
Power Transformer Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,535.00	\$5,535.00	\$13,500.00	\$13,500.00	\$12,485.00	\$12,485.00	NO BID	NO BID
Power Transformer Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$25,560.00	\$25,560.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Power Transformer Additional Field Services	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,100.00	\$4,100.00	NO BID	NO BID
Total Bid Cost Transformer/Services					\$1,381,795.00		\$1,462,500.00		\$1,244,717.00			
Circuit Switcher, 121 kV Class, 1200A, 40kA, Vertical	EA	2	\$37,470.00	\$74,940.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$38,863.00	\$77,726.00
Circuit Switcher Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	AS REQUIRED		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	AS LISTED	
Total Bid Cost Circuit Switcher				\$74,940.00								
Vacuum Circuit Breaker, 27 kV Class, 1200A, 25kA	EA	9	NO BID	NO BID	\$18,500.00	\$166,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15,859.00	\$142,731.00
Vacuum Circuit Breaker Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	AS LISTED	
Total Bid Cost Vacuum Circuit Breaker					\$168,300.00							
Total Base Bid Cost				\$74,940.00	\$1,550,095.00		\$1,462,500.00		\$1,244,717.00		\$220,457.00	

ITB 18-18 Smyrna Substation Equipment			STUART IRBY		WEG Transformers USA		Pennsylvania Transformer		SPX Waukesha			
DESCRIPTION	UOM	QTY	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
Power Transformer, 115-23 kV, 18/24/30//33.6 MVA, with LTC	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	\$587,629.00	\$1,175,258.00	\$706,326.00	\$1,412,652.00	\$763,882.00	\$1,527,764.00		
Power Transformer Installation and Field Testing	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$80,608.00	\$80,608.00	\$34,720.00	\$34,720.00		
Power Transformer Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$10,400.00	\$10,400.00	\$25,760.00	\$25,760.00	NO BID	NO BID		
Power Transformer Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,840.00	\$2,840.00		
Power Transformer Additional Field Services	LS		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Total Bid Cost Transformer/Services					\$1,235,658.00 DOES NOT INCLUDE FRIEGHT & OFFLOADING		\$1,519,020.00		\$1,565,324.00			
Circuit Switcher, 121 kV Class, 1200A, 40kA, Vertical	EA	2	\$48,830.00	\$97,660.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Circuit Switcher Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	AS REQUIRED		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Total Bid Cost Circuit Switcher			\$97,660.00									
Vacuum Circuit Breaker, 27 kV Class, 1200A, 25kA	EA	9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Vacuum Circuit Breaker Additional Spare Parts	LS	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Total Bid Cost Vacuum Circuit Breaker												
Total Base Bid Cost			\$97,660.00		\$1,235,658.00		\$1,519,020.00		\$1,565,324.00			